



SOUTH HILLS AREA COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS
2600 Old Greentree Road • Carnegie, PA 15106-3732
412-429-1130 • Fax: 412-429-3830

BID TABULATION

CD 46 7.5
Scott Park Poolhouse ADA Restroom
Township of Scott

Bid Opening: November 13, 2020 - 11:00 AM

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION		
BIDDER	BASE BID	ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1
1. Swede Construction Corporation	\$ 14,830.00	\$ 125.00
2. Select Contracting, LLC	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 200.00
3. Plavchak Construction	\$ 19,571.00	\$ 100.00
4. U&S Construction	\$ 21,300.00	\$ 600.00
5. M.A. Dunn Construction Co.	\$ 21,994.00	\$ 225.00
6. Excaliber Construction, LLC	NO BID	NO BID
7. FMS Construction	NO BID	NO BID

PLUMBING		
BIDDER	BASE BID	ADD ALTERNATE NO. 1
1. U&S Construction	\$ 11,500.00	\$ 4,350.00
2. Select Contracting, LLC	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 2,800.00
3. Plavchak Construction	\$ 12,600.00	\$ 1,400.00
4. M.A. Dunn Construction Co.	\$ 13,950.50	\$ 2,179.25
5. Excaliber Construction, LLC	NO BID	NO BID
6. FMS Construction	NO BID	NO BID
7. Swede Construction Corporation	NO BID	NO BID